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AMRA/MAP 

ANTI -TRUST DISCLAIMER 
CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION AGREEMENT 

 
DISCLAIMER TO BE AGREED TO AT THE BEGINNING OF ASSOCIATION CONFERENCE CALLS AND MEETINGS: 
 
At ALL meetings of the Automotive Maintenance and Repair Association and the Motorist 
Assurance Program, there will be no discussion, expressly or impliedly, which may lead to price 
fixing, a boycott of another's business, or other conduct that is intended to illegally restrict 
free trade.   
 
Any discussions that encourage or facilitate an agreement about the following subjects are 
inappropriate and must be avoided.  This includes discussion of: prices, discounts, or terms or 
conditions of sale; salaries; profits, profit margins or cost data; market share(s), sales 
territories, or markets; allocation of customers or territories; or selection, rejection or 
termination of customers or suppliers of goods and/or services.  
 
In the event that any inappropriate discussion is brought to the attention of an officer or staff 
member of the association, appropriate action will be taken. 
 
All participants at the meeting, including MEMBERS and NON-MEMBERS, also agree that the 
information discussed is to remain confidential among the attendees, and agree not to 
appropriate, reproduce, disclose, permit to be disclosed or use any information discussed at 
an AMRA/MAP session, in any way, by his/her organization until after the meeting attendees, 
or as appropriate/necessary the organization Board or membership, approve the action, 
document, etc.   
 
This confidential information shall include, but is not limited to, information regarding the 
organization, operations, programs, activities, policies, procedures, practices, financial 
condition, trade secrets, membership, meeting attendance or customer lists, and unpublished 
standards of AMRA/MAP, its members, customers or third parties.  Confidential Information 
also shall include, but is not limited to, unpublished or pre-release versions of AMRA/MAP’s 
documents and information, and internal use only or limited circulation documents and 
information. 
 


